

PERSSON, COHEN & MOONEY, P.A.
6853 Energy Court
Lakewood Ranch, FL 34240

Ph: (941) 306-4730

Fax: (941) 306-4832

The Town of Longboat Key
501 Bay Isles Road
Longboat Key, Florida 34228

October 6, 2020

ACCT. # LBK.WW.Lit

RE: Wastewater Line Claims

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	ATTY
9-01-2020	Conf call w/ TM, I Brownman, E Steinmeyer and J. Fiveash re: information gathering, consultants	0.80	MM
9-04-2020	Phone call w/ E Steinmeyer re: update; confer with TM on same.	0.60	MM
9-09-2020	Phone call w/ E Steinmeyer re: FDEP discussions and status	0.50	MM
9-10-2020	Receipt and review draft consent order and penalties calculation; phone call with TM re: same.	1.00	MM
9-11-2020	Phone call w/ E Steinmeyer re: consent and BRG report; conf call w/ E Steinmeyer, TM and I Brownman re consent order, shade meetings and consultant report	1.50	MM
9-14-2020	Emails re: communications with FDEP	0.25	MM
9-15-2020	Review draft BRG report; confer w/ E Steinmeyer and TM re: report and findings; edit and comment on press release; receipt of public records request; review multiple emails re: same	2.75	MM
9-16-2020	Phone call w/ J. Fiveash re: peer review; phone call and emails w/ D. Ramba re: redundant line funding and powerpoint ; phone call with TM re: same ; review press on BRG findings.	1.80	MM
9-17-2020	Emails re: shade meeting scheduling; phone call w/ Rep Robinson on status	0.50	MM
9-17-2020	Phone call w/ J. Fiveash re: shade meeting scheduling	0.30	MM
9-18-2020	Emails re: potential shade meeting scheduling ; begin preparing notice	0.80	MM
9-23-2020	Emails w/ court reporter for possible shade meeting coordination	0.25	MM

PERSSON & COHEN, P.A.

Acct. #: LBK.WW.Lit

Page 2

October 6, 2020

9-24-2020	Emails w/ TM and Town Clerk re: shade meeting notices preparation; phone call w / TM and Clerk on status of Governor Exec. Orders, notices, meetings and other pending matters	1.00	MM
9-28-2020	Phone calls and emails w/ TM and E Steinmeyer re: DEP Consent order and Shade meeting scheduling ; emails w/ TC re: same; emails w/ court reporter re: availability for Shade meeting, Shade Meeting notice and meeting coordination; finalize and prepare Notice of Virtual Shade meeting for same; review letter to FDEP confirming receipt of consent order	4.80	MM
9-29-2020	Multiple emails in preparation for Shade Meeting and step by step instructions for Commissioners, Environmental Counsel, Court Reporter, review and edit instructions; emails and phone call with TM and B Bishop on unavailability for Shade Meeting and alternatives; Review and revise and email Mayor and Vice Mayor revised Mayor notes; multiple emails w/ Court Reporter on Shade Meeting and attendees; emails with Environmental Counsel on Shade Meeting, power point presentation for Shade Mtg, and separate virtual mtg with B. Bishop	2.10	MM
9-30-2020	Emails and review of materials for Shade Meeting discussion; emails re: requests from media; Individual Phone calls w/ Comm. Daly and Mayor re: upcoming Shade meeting; phone calls with E Steinmeyer and TM re: Shade meeting matters; emails and communications with Court Reporter re: transcription of A/C Session and links; emails w/ J. Keen re: shade meeting ; emails w/ J. Keen on Shade meeting; email E. Steinmeyer and J. Fiveash relevant press; review proposed consent order in preparation for Shade Meeting; attendance at shade meeting (virtual)	5.80	MM

TOTAL HOURS

24.75

Total Fees for Above Services:

\$6,039.00

DISBURSEMENTS :

Total Disbursements:

\$0.00

Total Fees & Disbursements

\$6,039.00

Previous Balance

\$3,090.60

Payments

\$3,090.60

Balance Due Now

\$6,039.00

LAWYER

HOURS

EFFECTIVE RATE

AMOUNT

PERSSON & COHEN, P.A.

Acct. #: LBK.WW.Lit

Page 3

October 6, 2020

Maggie Mooney	24.75	\$244.00	\$6,039.00
---------------	-------	----------	------------