

**PERSSON, COHEN & MOONEY, P.A.**  
**6853 Energy Court**  
**Lakewood Ranch, FL 34240**

**Ph: (941) 306-4730**

**Fax: (941) 306-4832**

The Town of Longboat Key  
501 Bay Isles Road  
Longboat Key, Florida 34228

November 5, 2020

ACCT. #                      LBK.WW.Lit

RE:            Wastewater Line Claims

<b>DATE</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION</b>	<b>HOURS</b>	<b>ATTY</b>
10-01-2020	Phone calls and emails w/ TM and E Steinmeyer re: upcoming zoom/call w/ B Bishop, proposed consent order and coordination on same; emails w/ J. Keen on same; phone call w/ TM on notice from DEP on consent order	1.30	MM
10-06-2020	Review draft consent order in preparation for conf call with same.	1.40	MM
10-08-2020	Email from M. Barfield on Consent Order inquiry; email w/ TM on same	0.20	MM
10-09-2020	Emails w/ TM re: Suncoast Water Keepers and request to meet; Phone call with TM on same	0.40	MM
10-13-2020	Email TC update on next steps and potential future Shade Meeting; phone call with Mayor on same	1.00	MM
10-13-2020	Phone call and email w/ E Steinmeyer re: communications with FDEP and extension timing	0.60	MM
10-14-2020	Multiple emails with court report re: Shade meeting transcript from Sept. meeting and scheduling of Oct. 19 meeting; review and edit shade meeting notice; email same; phone call and emails w/ E Steinmeyer re status, upcoming shade meeting, timing and extension, call to discuss same. Review Mayors notes for 10/19 shade meeting.	2.10	MM
10-15-2020	Conf call on upcoming Shade meeting, recommendation, next steps, extension; prepare emails to TC re: withdrawal of request for Shade Meeting; emails cancelling court reporter for Shade Meeting; provide edits and comments to extension request to FDEP	1.50	MM
10-21-2020	Conf call and emails re: preparation for discussion with FDEP, media inquiry; follow up with TM on same	2.00	MM
10-22-2020	Phone call w/ E Steinmeyer re: upcoming call with FDEP; conf call w/ FDEP , Environmental Attorney, TM, I Brownman re: consent order; follow up w/ TM on same.	2.50	MM
10-26-2020	Reciept and review edits to proposed consent order from environmental counsel	1.00	MM

**PERSSON & COHEN, P.A.**

Acct. #: LBK.WW.Lit

Page 2

November 5, 2020

10-26-2020	Review proposed edits to proposed consent order from E Steinmeyer	1.00	MM
10-27-2020	Zoom call w/ Environmental counsel, TM and I Brownman re: proposed consent order edits; review document prepared by I Brownman re: proposed consent order comments on maintenance; follow up conf call with D. Ramba, E Steinmeyer and TM; email items for records request and comments on proposed consent order edits; review proposed transmittal to FDEP; phone call with TM re: follow up items and timing; prepare bullet point summary of proposed consent order edits; emails re: same	4.25	MM
10-28-2020	Confer with TM on Bullet points relating to consent order and objections; review and revise bullet points; prepare draft correspondence to TC on proposed consent order; emails re: public records request to FDEP; communications w/ D. Ramba	1.60	MM
10-29-2020	Emails re: proposed consent order edits and records request; finalize and transmit email TC re: update on communications with FDEP	1.00	MM

**TOTAL HOURS**

21.85

Total Fees for Above Services:

\$5,429.73

**DISBURSEMENTS :**

Total Disbursements:

\$0.00

Total Fees & Disbursements

\$5,429.73

Previous Balance

\$6,039.00

Payments

\$6,039.00

Balance Due Now

\$5,429.73

LAWYER	HOURS	EFFECTIVE RATE	AMOUNT
Maggie Mooney	21.85	\$248.50	\$5,429.73